
 

 
 

 

 
 

Activity Link  More information 

 

https://www.youtube.com/u
ser/ArtforKidsHub 

Family fun ‘Arty’ YouTube channel.  

 

https://www.thebestideasfor
kids.com/ 

Lots of fun craft ideas to try out at 
home with your family.  

 

https://apps.apple.com/gb/a
pp/paint-sparkles-
draw/id435539858 
 
https://play.google.com/stor
e/apps/details?id=com.tabtal
e.paintsparklesdraw&gl=GB 

Free App.  
Draw lines and pictures which sparkle 
and make music.  
In app purchases. 

 

 
 

Activity Link  More information 

 

https://apps.apple.com/us/a
pp/kids-musical-

instruments/id1186647039 

Free App. 
Let kids play and enjoy musical 
instruments like piano, xylophone, 
drums and shaky toys. 
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https://play.google.com/stor
e/apps/details?id=com.kidsta
tic.kidsmusicinstruments&gl=

GB 

Free App.  
Play the xylophone and tap along with 
the drum, electric guitar, grand piano, 
saxophone and tambourine.  
In app purchases.  

 

https://play.google.com/stor
e/apps/details?id=com.appq

uiz.baby.musical 

Free App. 
Play the piano, xylophone and drums 
in different animated scenes with 
exciting performances by cute animals.  
In app purchases.  

 

https://apps.apple.com/gb/a
pp/drum-kit/id306474530 

Free App. 
Good cause and effect drum kit.  
In app purchases. 

 

https://www.youtube.com/c
hannel/UCQh2wgJ5tOrixYBn

6jFXsXQ 

Music lessons with Myleene Klass. 

 

 
 

Activity Link More information 

 

https://www.bbc.co.uk/cbee
bies/curations/science-
activities 

Discover fun science experiments and 
watch clips with CBeebies friends, 
helping children to learn science 
through play. 

 

https://www.nasa.gov/kidscl
ub/index.html 

Try out the games, check out the latest 
news about the satellite launches, look 
at photos from space and watch 
interviews of astronauts. 
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https://wecanaccess.com/te
aching-special-needs-kids-at-
home-science-and-waking-
up/ 

Great ideas to make conversations and 
things to look at while you and your 
child are getting ready for the day. 

 

 
 

Activity Link More information 

 

https://apps.apple.com/gb/a
pp/fireworks-
arcade/id435664934 
 
https://play.google.com/stor
e/apps/details?id=com.bigdu
ckgames.fireworksarcade&gl
=GB 

Free App. 
Coloured fireworks and sound effects 
appear when screen touched. 

 

https://apps.apple.com/us/a
pp/fluidity-hd/id399403909 

Free App. 
Interactive light and music sparkly fluid 
flow. 

 

https://education.minecraft.
net/ 

Explore the world of Minecraft with 
educational videos and games. 

 

https://blockly.games/maze?
lang=en&level=2&skin=0 

Can you do some simple programming 
to move the person around the maze. 
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https://scratch.mit.edu/ Create Stories, games and animations.  

 

 

https://www.terrapinlogo.co
m/emu/beebot.html 
 
https://apps.apple.com/gb/a
pp/bee-bot/id500131639 
 
https://play.google.com/stor
e/apps/details?id=com.tts.be
ebot 

Can you use some simple coding to 
programme the Bee-Bot. 

 

 
 

Activity Link More information 

 

https://2simple.com/purple-
mash/ 

Lots of fun online games and activities 
to do. You can login and access your 
rowan class page. 

 

https://www.bbc.co.uk/bitesi
ze/primary 

Explore lots of Art, Science, Music and 
Technology games and activities. 

 

https://www.thenational.aca
demy/online-
classroom/specialist/commu
nication-and-
language#subjects 

Fun, engaging and motivational 
creative Art, Music and Dance sessions 
to support holistic development 
opportunities. 
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Activity Link  More information 

 

https://www.edinburghzoo.o
rg.uk/webcams/panda-cam/ 

Explore Edinburgh Zoo and say hello to 
the Panda, Penguins, Lion, Tiger and 
Koala.   

 

https://www.dublinzoo.ie/an
imals/ 

Head on over (virtually) to Ireland’s 
capital city zoo and say hello to the 
Elephants, Penguins and Giraffes.  

 

https://zoo.sandiegozoo.org/
live-cams 

Explore San Diego Zoo and visit the 
Safari Park and see what animals you 
can see from the comfort of your own 
home. 

 

https://www.chesterzoo.org/
virtual-zoo-2/ 

Join Chester Zoo for their whole day 
virtual zoo experience. You can re-
watch previous episodes. 

 

https://explore.org/livecams/
african-wildlife/african-
animal-lookout-camera 

Go on your own virtual African Safari 
and see what animals you can spot. 

 

http://www.flaquarium.org/s
ea-span 

Enjoy daily content from The Florida 
Aquarium. 
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https://www.folly-
farm.co.uk/webcams/barn-
webcam/ 

See what animals are on the farm. You 
might see some Sheep, Lambs and 
Goats. 

 

https://www.thechinaguide.c
om/destination/great-wall-
of-china 

Go for a virtual walk along the Great 
Wall of China. 

 

https://earth.google.com/we
b/ 

Can you find where you live, where 
Rowan school is and search other 
countries and cities using Google 
Earth?   
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https://www.bbcgoodfood.com/howto/guide/playdough-recipe?fbclid=IwAR1hSYQmRSHnYfqfwXTA59UmkVZGvsSo6W1zA46KUax2uKlgezaNGFGOYmU


 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 


